
COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #301   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      02/14/08  
 
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT 

NUMBER 621-0975 RELATIVE TO THE CONSTRUCTION, OPERATION 
AND MAINTENANCE OF THE WILLIAMS CORNER AREA WATER 
TANK PROJECT LOCATED IN GOSHEN TOWNSHIP...07-1226-009 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 621-0975 RELATIVE TO 
THE CONSTRUCTION, OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF THE WILLIAMS 
CORNER AREA WATER TANK PROJECT LOCATED IN GOSHEN TOWNSHIP: 
 

Bidder Tank and Electrical Tank Only Electrical Only 

CB&I 
Chicago Bridge & Iron Company 
Blaymore II, Suite 201 
1603 Carmody Court 
Sewickley, PA 15143 

$4,024,000.00 No Bid No Bid 

Lake Erie Electric, Inc. 
360 Industrial Drive 
Franklin, Ohio 45005 

No Bid No Bid $89,560.00 

Caldwell Tanks, LLC 
PO Box 35774 
Louisville, Kentucky 40232-5770 

No Bid $3,725,000.00 No Bid 

Queen City Electric 
4015 Cherry Street 
Cincinnati, Ohio 45223 

No Bid No Bid $71,645.00 

 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT 
COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 
DISPOSITION THEREOF.      
 
Engineer=s Estimate:  $3,667,465.00 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #301   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      02/14/08  
 
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT…BID OPENING FOR SLUDGE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR SAME…07-1130-004 
 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 
UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR SLUDGE 
MANAGEMENT SERVICES: 
 

Bidder Bid Amount 
#1 

Bid Amount 
#2 

Bid Amount 
#3 

Bid Amount 
#4 

Bid Amount 
#5 

Bid Amount 
#6 

Bid Amount 
#7 

Total Bid 
Amount 

Rumpke 
10795 Hughes Rd. 
Cincinnati, Ohio 45251 

$1.38 
Total  
$4,598.16 

$0.45 
Total  
$116,028.00 

$0.80 
Total    
$72,968.00 

$1.57 
Total    
$60,358.65 

$0.60 
Total   
$35,904.00 

$0.49 
Total    
$26,011.65 

 $1.00 
Total    
$72,330.00 

$388,198.46 

Schimleys Excavating, 
Inc. 
1256 North Main Street 
Niles, Ohio 44446 

$0.90 
Total 
$2,998.80 

$0.49 
Total   
$126,341.60 

$0.45 
Total   
$41,044.50 

$0.65 
Total   
$24,989.25 

$0.49 
Total   
$29,321.60 

$0.60 
Total   
$31,851.00 

$0.60 
Total   
$43,398.00 

$299,944.75 

Synagro 
1800 Bering Drive 
Suite 1000 
Houston, Texas 77057 

$1.30 
Total   
$4,331.60 

$0.4437 
Total   
$114,403.61 

$0.558 
Total 
$50,895.18 

$0.586 
Total   
$22,528.77 

$0.443 
Total   
$25,910.72 

$0.515 
Total   
$27,338.78 

$0.664 
Total   
$48,027.12 

$293,435.78 

Utter Construction, Inc. 
779 Prather Road 
Felicity, Ohio 45120 

$0.379 
Total 
$1,262.83 

$0.256 
Total 
$66,007.04 

$0.269 
Total 
$24,535.49 

$0.286 
Total 
$10,995.27 

$0.280 
Total 
$16,755.20 

$0.282 
Total 
$14,969.97 

$0.294 
Total 
$21,265.02 

$155,790.82 

 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND 
RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.      
 
Estimated Cost:  $285,193.00 Annually 
 


