
COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      05/11/06  
 
 
IN RE:  CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT/ COUNTY WATER WORKS…BID OPENING 

RELATIVE TO THE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF WATER LINES AND 
APPURTENANCES FOR SAME…06- 0407- 002 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:   THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF 
THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2: 00 P. M.  LOCAL TIME THIS 
DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE 
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF WATER LINES AND APPURTENANCES:   
 

Bidder Bid Amount 

J. Daniel & Company, Inc. 
1975 Phoenix Drive 
Loveland, Ohio 45140 

$874,118.00 

Schweitzer Construction Co. 
325 Clark Road 
Cincinnati, Ohio 45215 

$1,320,440.00 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER,  CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER 
DISTRICT,  FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.   
    

 
 
Cost  Est i mat e:   $800, 000. 00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      05/11/06  
 
 
 
 
IN RE:  CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT/ COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM. . . BID 

OPENING RELATIVE TO GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON ( GAC)  MEDIA 
INSTALLATION FOR SAME…06- 0406- 006 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:   THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF 
THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2: 00 P. M.  LOCAL TIME THIS 
DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER 
RELATIVE TO GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON ( GAC)  MEDIA INSTALLATION:  
 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Norit Americas Inc. 
3200 W. University Avenue 
PO Box 790 
Marshall, Texas 75671 

$264,000.00 

Carbon Activated Corporation 
109 Hunters Ridge 
Orchard Park, New York 14127-1674 

$269,250.00 

Calgon Carbon Corporation 
PO Box 717 
Pittsburgh, PA 15230-0717 
 

$283,117.00 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER,  CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER 
DISTRICT,  FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.   
    

 
 
Engi neer=s  Est i mat e:   $250, 000. 00 

 
 
 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      05/11/06  
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT/COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM…BID OPENING RELATIVE TO THE FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR SAME…06-0406-005 
 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY 
COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER 
RELATIVE TO THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS: 
 

Bidder Item  
1 
Delivered 
Cost per 
100 
gallons 

Item 
2A 
Delivere
d Cost 
per 
Cylinder 

Item 
2B 
Delivered 
Cost per 
Cylinder 

Item 
2C 
Delivered 
Cost per 
Cylinder 

Item  
3A 
Delivered 
Cost 
carboy 

Item  
3B 
Delivered 
Cost per 
100 
gallons 

Item 
3C 
Delivered 
Cost per 
drum 

Item 
4A 
Delivered 
Cost per 
55 gallon 
drum 

Item  
4B 
Delivered 
Cost per 
55 gallon 
drum 

Item  
4C 
Delivered 
Cost per 
100 
gallons 

Item  
5 
Delivered cost 
per drum 
 

 
 
Total Bid 
Amount 

Univar USA, Inc. 
4600 Dues Drive 
Cincinnati, Ohio  45246 

$54.94 $59.00 $480.00 $480.00 $40.50 $138.00 $99.00 $122.40 $122.40 $119.50 $686.40 $352,042.20 

General Chemical 
Corporation 
90 East Halsey Road 
Parsippany, New Jersey 
07054-3705 

$52.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $95, 256.00 

Bonded Chemicals, Inc. 
2645 Charter Street 
Columbus, Ohio  43228 

No Bid $64.50 No Bid No Bid $29.925 $119.70 $98.175 $105.00 $105.00 $129.76 $631.7325 $297,500.00 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND 
RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.      
 
Cost Estimate:  $470,000.00 


