
COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING     06/08/06  
 
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT 

NUMBER 651-0867 RELATIVE TO THE MIDDLE EAST FORK 
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT MECHANICAL SCREENS 
REPLACEMENT PROJECT LOCATED IN BATAVIA TOWNSHIP...06-0424-
002 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 651-0867 RELATIVE TO 
THE MIDDLE EAST FORK WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT MECHANICAL 
SCREENS REPLACEMENT PROJECT LOCATED WITHIN BATAVIA TOWNSHIP: 
 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Cooper’s Excavating, LLC 
7251 Bethlehem Road 
Winchester, Ohio  45697 

$317,000.00 

Kerry Smith Contractors, Inc. 
P.O. Box 480 
Lawrenceburg, Kentucky  40342 

$391,000.00 

Ameritcon, Inc. 
4324 Webster Street 
Dayton, Ohio  45414 

$295,000.00 

Building Crafts Incorporated 
2 Rosewood Drive 
P.O. Box 286 
Wilder, Kentucky  41076 

$348,348.00 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT 
COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 
DISPOSITION THEREOF.      

 
 
Engineer=s Estimate:  $338,750.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING     06/08/06  
 
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT…BID OPENING RELATIVE TO 

SLUDGE/RAW WASTEWATER HAULING SERVICES FOR SAME…06-
0501-003 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER RELATIVE TO SLUDGE/RAW WASTEWATER 
HAULING SERVICES: 
 

Bidder Bid 
Amount 
# 1 

Bid 
Amount 
# 2 

Bid 
Amount 
# 3  

Bid 
Amount 
# 4 

Bid 
Amount 
# 5 

Bid 
Amount 
# 6 

Bid 
Amount 
# 7 

Southern Ohio Sanitation 
3049 Old State Route 32 
Batavia, Ohio  45103 

$0.04 $.0.05 $0.06 $160.00 $160.00 $65.00 $95.00 

Gullett Sanitation Services, 
Inc. 
118 South Union Street 
P.O. Box 59 
Bethel, Ohio  45106-0059 

$0.05955 $0.05955 $0.0685 $114.07 $309.20 $99.50 $174.50 

Synagro Central, LLC 
1800 Bering Drive 
Suite 1000 
Houston, TX  77057 

$0.098 $0.045 $0.070 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT 
COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 
DISPOSITION THEREOF.      

 
 
Engineer=s Estimate:  $52,500.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING     06/08/06  
 
IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT…BID OPENING RELATIVE TO 

THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF POLYMER FOR SAME…06-0501-
002 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER RELATIVE TO THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY 
OF POLYMER: 
 

Bidder Bid Amount  
Item # 1 

Bid Amount  
Item # 2 

Bid Amount  
Item # 3 

Bid Amount  
Item # 4 

Tidewater Products, Inc. 
P.O. Box 23181 
Toledo, Ohio 43623 

$1.82 $1.17 $1.27 $1.32 

Polydyne Inc.  
P.O. Box 279 
One Chemical Plant 
Road 
Riceboro, GA  31323 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Synagro Central, LLC 
1800 Bering Drive 
Suite 1000 
Houston, TX  77057 

$2.38 $1.68 $1.68 No Bid 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, CLERMONT 
COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 
DISPOSITION THEREOF.      

 
 
Engineer=s Estimate:  $133,317.00 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #298   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING     06/08/06  
 
 
 
 
IN RE: COUNTY ENGINEER...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT NUMBER RS-01-06 

RELATIVE TO THE 2006 ROAD RESURFACING PROGRAM PROJECT 
LOCATED IN VARIOUS TOWNSHIPS...06-0508-001 

 
LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER RE-01-06 RELATIVE TO 
THE 2006 ROAD RESURFACING PROGRAM PROJECT LOCATED IN VARIOUS 
TOWNSHIPS: 
 

Bidder Bid Amount 

John R. Jurgensen Company 
11641 Mosteller Road 
Cincinnati, Ohio  45241 

$1,465,320.15 
     $77,188.70 Alternate 

Barrett Paving Materials Inc.  
600 Shepard Ave 
Cincinnati, Ohio  45215 

$1,407,632.54 
     $83,535.17 Alternate 

 
 
SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO PATRICK MANGER, CLERMONT 
COUNTY ENGINEER, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR 
DISPOSITION THEREOF.      

 
 
Engineer=s Estimate:  $1,300,000.00 

 
 


