COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #300 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  06/21/07

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT/COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...BID OPENING FOR FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
CHEMICALS FOR SAME...07-0521-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS
UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR FURNISHING AND

DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS:

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, DIRECTOR OF UTILITIES, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR

Bidder Item Item Item Item Item Item Item Item Item Item Item
1 2A 2B 2C 3A 3B 3C 4A 4B 4C 5
Delivered | Delivere Delivere Delivered | Delivered | Delivered Delivered | Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered
Cost per d Cost d Cost Cost per Cost Cost per Cost per Cost per 55 | Costper55 | Cost per cost per
100 per per Cylinder carboy 100 gallons | drum gallon gallon 100 gallons | drum
gallons Cylinder Cylinder drum drum

Bonded Chemicals, Inc. $70.2075 | $58.50 No Bid No Bid $41.48 $196.50 $142.45 $108.50 $108.50 $137.40 $674.07

2645 Charter Street

Columbus, Ohio 43228

Univar USA Inc. $70.00 $65.00 $510.00 | $510.00 $57.00 No Bid $165.00 $122.00 $122.00 $137.00 $709.00

4600 Dues Drive

Cincinnati, Ohio 45246

General Chemical $61.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 East Halsey Road

Parsippany, New Jersey 07054-3705

Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. $72.00 $60.00 $460.00 $460.00 $38.70 $170.00 $105.60 $108.90 $108.90 $142.58 $748.50

110 Carley Drive

Georgetown, Kentucky 40324

DISPOSITION THEREOF.

Cost Estimate: $500,000.00




COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #300 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  06/21/07

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY ENGINEER...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT
NUMBER RS-01-07 RELATIVE TO THE 2007 ROAD RESURFACING
PROGRAM LOCATED IN VARIOUS TOWNSHIPS...07-0521-002

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M.LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER RS-01-07 RELATIVE TO
THE 2007 ROAD RESURFACING PROGRAM:

Bidder Bid Amount Alternate Bid Amount

John R. Jurgensen Company $1,294,075.25 $77,576.00
11641 Mosteller Road
Cincinnati, Ohio 45241

Barrett Paving Materials, Inc. $1,258,578.86 $84,338.26
600 Shepherd Avenue
Cincinnati, Ohio 45215

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO PAT MANGER, CLERMONT
COUNTY ENGINEER, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR
DISPOSITION THEREOF.

Engineer=s Estimate: $1,450,000.00



