COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #300 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  07/19/07

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT...BID OPENING FOR THE
UTILITY BILLING SYSTEM FOR SAME...07-0525-004

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M.LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE UTILITY BILLING SYSTEM FOR THE
CLERMONT COUNTY SEWER DISTRICT:

Bidder Utility Bid Amount Accounts Receivable Bid Amount

Advanced Utility Systems, Corp. $471,510.00 No Bid
2235 Sheppard Ave E.
Floor: 14 Unit: 1400
North York

Ontario, Canada M2J5B5

New World Systems $530,349.00 $60,800.00
888 W. Big Beaver Road
Suite 600

Troy, Michigan 48084

Harris Computer Systems $477,120.00 $32,400.00
1 Antares Drive

Floor: 4 Unit: 400
Nepean

Ontario, Canada K2E8C4

Utility Business Services, Inc. $371,855.00 No Bid
1085 Morris Avenue
Union, New Jersey 07083

Tyler Technologies, Inc. $494.250.00 No Bid
370 U.S. Route One
Falmouth, Maine 04105-1308

Software Solutions, Inc. $92,838.25 $6,320.00
420 E. Main St.
Lebanon, Ohio 45036

Springbrook Software $318,528.00 $24,042.00
111 SW Fifth Avenue, Suite 2900
Portland, Oregon 97204

Harris Computer System $458,715.00 No Bid
112 East Line Street, Suite 200
Tyler, Texas 75702-5760

Cogsdale Corporation $454,870.00 No Bid
14 MacAleer Drive, Suite 5
Charlottetown PE C1E2A1
Canada

Donald R. Frey & Company, Inc. No Bid Sheet No Bid Sheet
40 Grand Avenue, Suite 303
Fort Thomas, Kentucky 41075-1765

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED SUKIE SCHEETZ, OFFICE OF
MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET, FOR HER REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR
DISPOSITION THEREOF.




COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #300 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  07/19/07

IN RE: DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY PLANNING AND DEVELOPMENT...
BID OPENING FOR PROJECT NUMBER 2006-02 RELATIVE TO THE
VILLAGE OF NEWTONSVILLE STORM WATER AND ROADWAY

SYSTEMS PROJECT

IN CONCERT WITH THE COMMUNITY

DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT (CDBG) FORMULA PROGRAM FOR
FISCAL YEAR 2006...07-0622-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M.LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 2006-02 RELATIVE TO
THE VILLAGE OF NEWTONSVILLE STORM WATER AND ROADWAY SYSTEMS
PROJECT IN CONCERT WITH THE COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT
(CDBG) FORMULA PROGRAM FOR FISCAL YEAR 2006:

Bidder Bid Amount
Rose Excavating & Development, Inc. $66,357.50
1272 Wilson-Dunham Road

New Richmond, Ohio 45157

Cooper’s Excavating, LLC $58,409.00
7251 Bethlehem Road

Winchester, Ohio 45697

Smith Construction $64,930.00
P.O. Box 223

Fayetteville, Ohio 45118

Trend Construction $79,253.00
11148 Woodward Lane

Cincinnati, Ohio 45241

Over Stake Farm Drainage, Inc. $68,569.00

Box 300
128 W. Main Street
Mowrystown, Ohio 45155

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TIM HERSHNER, CLERMONT
COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PLANNING AND COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT, FOR
HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.

Engineer=s Estimate: $80,000.00




