COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #295 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  09/09/04

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY ENGINEER...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT
NUMBER BX-02-04 RELATIVE TO THE PURCHASE OF ALUMINUM
BOX CULVERTS FOR THE BRUSHY FORK ROAD BRIDGE
REPLACEMENTS PROJECT LOCATED IN STONELICK
TOWNSHIP...04-0519-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN
THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME ON THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED
AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER BX-02-04
RELATIVE TO THE PURCHASE OF ALUMINUM BOX CULVERTS FOR THE
BRUSHY FORK ROAD BRIDGE REPLACEMENTS PROJECT LOCATED IN
STONELICK TOWNSHIP:

Bidder Bid Amount
Buckeye Culvert & Supply Co., Inc. Item #1 $40,586.40
3013 Noddin Way Item #2 $42,261.21
Portsmouth, Ohio 45662 No Bid Bond

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO PAT MANGER, COUNTY
ENGINEER, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION
THEREOF.

Engineer’s Estimate: $35,000.00 ITEM #1
$47,250.00 ITEM #2



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #295 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  09/09/04

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY
SERVICES...BID OPENING FOR HOMELAND SECURITY EQUIPMENT
FISCAL YEAR 2003 PART I AND PART Il, MODIFIED ITEMS...04-0819-
002

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN
THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME ON THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED
AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR HOMELAND SECURITY
EQUIPMENT FISCAL YEAR 2003 PART | AND PART Il, MODIFIED ITEMS:

Bidder Bid Amount

Global Protection, LLC Line 1 $ no bid
5 Stow Road, Suite H Line 2 $ no bid
Marlton, NJ 08053 Line 3 $ 695.50

Line 4 $737.23
Line 5 $ 781.46

Line 6 $ no bid

Line 7 $ no bid
Aramsco, Inc. Line 1 $18,999.99
1655 Imperial Way Line 2 $ 1,277.47
Thorofare, NJ 08086 Line 3 $450.00

Line 4 $ 460.00
Line 5 $ 485.10
Line 6 $ 509.35
Line 7 $534.78

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO BETH NEVEL, DIRECTOR,
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC SAFETY SERVICES, FOR HER REVIEW AND
RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.



COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #295 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  09/09/04

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY ENGINEER...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT
NUMBER 621-0680 RELATIVE TO THE BRANCH HILL/LOVELAND
AREA ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK PROJECT LOCATED IN
MIAMI TOWNSHIP...04-0804-004

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN
THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME ON THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED
AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 621-0680
RELATIVE TO THE BRANCH HILL/LOVELAND AREA ELEVATED WATER
STORAGE TANK PROJECT LOCATED IN MIAMI TOWNSHIP:

Bidder Bid Amount
Caldwell Tanks, Inc. $1,780,500.00 Tank and Electrical
4000 Tower Road $1,750,500.00 Tank

Louisville, Kentucky 40219

CB & | Constructors, Inc. $1,648,000.00 Tank
Blaymore 11, Suite 201
1603 Carmody Court

Sewickley, PA 15143

Lake Erie Electric, Inc. $29,950.00 Electrical
360 Industrial Drive
Franklin, Ohio 45005

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO TOM YEAGER, DIRECTOR OF
UTILITIES, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION
THEREOF.

Engineer=s Estimate: $ 2,184,020.00



