COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #312 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  04/28/16

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY FACILITIES MANAGEMENT
DEPARTMENT/FLEET MAINTENANCE...BID OPENING RELATIVE TO
THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF CONSIGNED REPAIR PARTS FOR
USE IN THE MAINTENANCE AND REPAIR OF COUNTY VEHICLES...16-
0304-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF
CONSIGNED REPAIR PARTS FOR USE IN THE MAINTENANC AND REPAIR OF
COUNTY VEHICLES:

Bidder Filter/Fluids | Brakes Suspension | Electrical | Tune Up | General
Supplies
KOI Enterprises, Inc. $5,261.80 $7,107.77 $497.66 $3,097.32 | $1,093.98 | $722.65

2701 Spring Grove Avenue
Cincinnati, Ohio 45225

O’Reilly Auto Enterprises $5,289.61 $4,306.78 $598.02 $3,423.79 | $874.44 $646.40
LLC

230 South Barnes

Springfield, Missouri 65802

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO WADE GRABOWSKI, CLERMONT
COUNTY FACILITIES MANAGEMENT DEPARTMENT/FLEET MAINTENANCE, FOR
HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.
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INRE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...16-0314-002

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY

OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATER WORKS SYSTEM:

Bidder Item 1A Item 2A Item 2B Item 2C Item 3A Item 3B Item 3C Item 4A Item 4B Item 4C Item 5A
Delivered | Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered
Cost Cost Per Cost Per 1 Cost Per 1 Cost Per 55 Cost Bulk Cost Per 55 Cost Per 55 Cost Bulk Cost Bulk Cost Per
Bulk 150 LB. Ton Ton Gallon Liquid-Per Gallon Gallon Liquid-Per | Liquid-Per 330 LB.
Liquid- Cylinder- | Cylinders- | Cylinder- Drums-Plus | 100 gallons Drum-Plus Drum-Plus 100 gallons | 100 gallons Drum-Plus
Per 100 Plus Plus Plus deposit deposit Fluoride- deposit deposit Caustic Caustic Soda- | deposit
Gallons- deposit deposit Chlorine Fluoride- BMW Fluoride- Caustic Soda-MGS | BMW Potassium
Alum- Chlorine- | Chlorine- PUB PUB MGS Soda-PUB Permangan
BMW MGS BMW ate-BMW

USALCO No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2601 Cannery Avenue

Baltimore, Maryland 21226

Shannon Chemical No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $181.81 $241.00 $181.81 No Bid No Bid No Bid $556.71

Corporation

P.O Box 376

Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355

Sal Chemical No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $179.20 $240.00 $196.00 $153.87 $76.20 $169.00 No Bid

3036 Birch Drive

Weirton, West Virginia 26062

F2 Industries, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $560.19

423 C Smyrna Square Drive

Smyrna, Tennessee 37167

Univar USA Inc. $133.30 $64.00 $500.00 $500.00 $153.00 $209.00 $153.00 $128.00 $78.00 $132.50 $569.25

4600 Dues Drive

Cincinnati, Ohio 45246

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. No Bid $57.00 $407.00 $407.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

600 Bethel Avenue

Beech Grove, Indiana 46107

Chemtrade Chemicals US $95.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

LLC

90 East Halsey Road

Parsippany, New Jersey

07054-3705




COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #312 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  04/28/16

Intentionally Blank

Bonded Chemicals, Inc. No Bid $81.00 No Bid No Bid $146.85 $235.00 $146.85 $110.25 $79.68 $145.47 $561.61
2645 Charter Street
Columbus, Ohio 43228

Brenntag Mid-South $135.00 $52.50 $359.00 $359.00 $164.40 $243.00 $164.40 $115.50 $87.30 $144.00 $660.00
324 East Yusen Drive
Georgetown, Kentucky 40324

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.
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