COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #310 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  01/09/14

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID
OPENING RELATIVE TO THE GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON (GAC)
CONTRACTOR MEDIA REACTIVATION...13-1115-003

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE GRANULAR ACTIVATED CARBON
(GAC) CONTRACTOR MEDIA REACTIVATION:

Bidder Bid Amount

Calgon Carbon Corporation $595,788.99
500 Calgon Carbon Drive
Pittsburgh, PA 15205

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT
COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND
RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.

Engineer’s Estimate: $700,000.00



COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #310 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  01/09/14

INRE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATER WORKS SYSTEM...13-1115-005

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY

OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATER WORKS SYSTEM:

Bidder Item 1 Item 2A Item 2B Item 2C Item 3A Item 3B Item 3C Item 4A Item 4B Item 4C Item 5
Delivered | Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered Delivered
Cost Cost Per Cost Per 1 Cost Per 1 Cost Per 55 Cost Bulk Cost Per 55 Cost Per 55 Cost Bulk Cost Bulk Cost Per
Bulk 150 LB. Ton Ton Gallon Liquid-Per Gallon Gallon Liquid-Per | Liquid-Per 330 LB.
Liquid- Cylinder- | Cylinders- | Cylinder- Drums-Plus | 100 gallons Drum-Plus Drum-Plus 100 gallons | 100 gallons Drum-Plus
Per 100 Plus Plus Plus deposit deposit Fluoride- deposit deposit Caustic Caustic Soda- | deposit
Gallons- deposit deposit Chlorine Fluoride- BMW Fluoride- Caustic Soda-MGS | BMW Potassium
Alum- Chlorine- | Chlorine- PUB PUB MGS Soda-PUB Permangan
BMW MGS BMW ate-BMW

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3211 Clinton Parkway Court

Lawrence, KS 66047

Pencco, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

P.O. Box 600

San Felipe, TX 77473

Bonded Chemicals, Inc. No Bid $75.00 No Bid No Bid $197.45 $286.62 $197.45 $120.40 $87.25 $165.40 $656.87

2645 Charter Street

Columbus, OH 43228

Marubeni Specialty No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $620.40

Chemicals, Inc.

8675 Hidden River Parkway

Tampa, FL 33637

Key Chemical, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $511.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

9503 Dovewood Place

Waxhaw, NC 28173

Chemrite, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $177.30 No Bid

5202 Belle Wood Court

Suite 104

Buford, GA 30518

JCI Jones Chemical, Inc. No Bid $54.50 $341.50 $341.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $104.00 $9.20/cwt $12.33/cwt No Bid

600 Bethel Avenue
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Beech Grove, IN 46107

Thatcher Company of New $106.93 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.92/Ib.
York, Inc.

P.O. Box 27407

Salt Lake City, UT 84127-
0407

F2 Industries, LLC No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $618.06
423 C Smyrna Square Drive
Smyrna, TN 37167

Water Solutions Unlimited No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $210.00 No Bid $220.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
P.O. Box 347, 295 Industrial
Drive

Franklin, IN 46131-0347

Univar USA Inc. $156.00 $58.00 $395.00 $395.00 $198.00 $286.00 $198.00 $139.90 $103.94 $166.14 $960.30
4600 Dues Drive
Cincinnati, OH 45246

General Chemical $91.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Performance Products, LLC
90 East Halsey Road
Parsippany, NJ 07054

Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. $150.00 $57.00 $358.00 $358.00 $198.55 $283.50 $198.55 $129.50 $87.23 $170.52 $666.60
324 East Yusen Drive
Georgetown, KY 40324

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.
Engineer’s Estimate: $700,000.00



COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #310 CLERMONT COUNTY  BID OPENING  01/09/14

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF JOB AND FAMILY
SERVICES...BID OPENING RELATIVE TO THE PURCHASE OF PRE-
PAID FUEL CARDS FOR USE BY ELIGIBLE PARTICIPANTS OF THE
TEMPORARY ASSISTANCE TO NEEDY FAMILIES (TANF) PROGRAM
AND THE NON-EMERGENCY TRANSPORTATION (NET) PROGRAM...13-
1202-017

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE
OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00
P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ
ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE PURCHASE OF PRE-PAID FUEL CARDS
FOR USE BY ELIGIBLE PARTICIPANTS OF THE TEMPORARY ASSISTANCE TO
NEEDY FAMILIES (TANF) PROGRAM AND THE NON-EMERGENCY
TRANSPORTATION (NET) PROGRAM:

Bidder

No Bid

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO JUDITH ESCHMANN, CLERMONT
COUNTY DEPARTMENT OF JOB AND FAMILY SERVICES, FOR HER REVIEW AND
RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.



