
 COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #311   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      03/05/15 
 

 

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID 

OPENING FOR PROJECT NUMBER 6402-62005 RELATIVE TO THE 

CONSTRUCTION, OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF THE 

COLLECTION SYSTEM REHABILITATION 2015 PROJECT LOCATED IN 

UNION, PIERCE, AND BATAVIA TOWNSHIPS…15-0108-010 

 

 

LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE 

OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 

P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ 

ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 6402-62005 RELATIVE TO 

THE CONSTRUCTION, OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE OF THE COLLECTION 

SYSTEM REHABILITATION 2015 PROJECT:   

 

 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Insituform Technologies, LLC 

17988 Edison Avenue 

Chesterfield, Missouri  63005 

$1,821,840.70 

 

 

SAID PROPOSALS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, 

CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND 

RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.      
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IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...15-0123-004 

 

LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY 

OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM: 

 

Bidder Item 1 

Delivere

d Cost 

Bulk 

Liquid-

Per 100 

Gallons-

Alum-

BMW 

Item 2A 

Delivered 

Cost Per 

150 LB. 

Cylinder-

Plus 

deposit 

Chlorine-

MGS 

Item 2B 

Delivered 

Cost Per 1 

Ton 

Cylinders-

Plus 

deposit 

Chlorine-

BMW 

Item 2C 

Delivered 

Cost Per 1 

Ton 

Cylinder-

Plus deposit 

Chlorine 

PUB 

Item 3A 

Delivered 

Cost Per 55 

Gallon 

Drums-Plus 

deposit 

Fluoride-

PUB 

Item 3B 

Delivered 

Cost Bulk 

Liquid-Per 

100 gallons 

Fluoride-

BMW 

Item 3C 

Delivered 

Cost Per 55 

Gallon 

Drum-Plus 

deposit 

Fluoride-

MGS 

Item 4A 

Delivered 

Cost Per 55 

Gallon 

Drum-Plus 

deposit 

Caustic 

Soda-PUB 

Item 4B 

Delivered 

Cost Bulk 

Liquid-Per 

100 gallons 

Caustic 

Soda-MGS 

Item 4C 

Delivered 

Cost Bulk 

Liquid-Per 

100 gallons 

Caustic Soda-

BMW 

Item 5 

Delivered 

Cost Per 

330 LB. 

Drum-Plus 

deposit 

Potassium 

Permangan

ate-BMW 

F2 Industries, LLC 

423 C Smyrna Square Drive 

Smyrna, Tennessee  37167 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $593.26/330 

lbs. 

Chemtrade Chemicals UC LLC 

90 East Halsey Road 

Parsippany, New Jersey 07054 

$94.50/  

100 

Gallons 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Bonded Chemicals, Inc. 

2645 Charter Street 

Columbus, Ohio  43228 

No Bid $78.00/ 

150 lbs. 

No Bid No Bid $186.45/550 

lbs. 

$258.00/100 

gallons 

$186.45/550 

lbs. 

$117.60/700 

lbs. 

$81.50/100 

gallons 

$152.96/100 

gallons 

$598.66/ 

330.75 lbs. 

Univar USA Inc. 

4600 Dues Drive 

Cincinnati, Ohio  45246 

$1.405 $53.90 $349.00 $349.00 $190.00 $2.45 $190.00 $131.57 $98.50 $1.52 $609.84 

JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 

1765 Ringling Boulevard 

Sarasota, Florida  34236 

No Bid $54.50 $341.50 $341.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $118.00 $95.00 $153.50 No Bid 

Shannon Chemical Corporation 

Post Office Box 376 

Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $204.44/55 

gallons 

$277.77/  

N/A 

$214.14/55 

gallons 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $669.69/330 

lbs. 

SAL Chemical Co., Inc. 

3036 Birch Drive 

Weirton, West Virginia  26062 

 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $241.92/560 

lbs. 

$298.25 $241.92/560 

lbs. 

$175.26/690 

lbs. 

$87.37 $176.33 No Bid 

SAID PROPOSALS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.  
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