
COMMISSIONERS= JOURNAL #315   CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      07/19/18 
 

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...18-0607-004 

 

LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY 

OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM: 

 

 

 

Bidder 

 

Item No. 1 

Aluminum 

Sulfate 

Item No. 2a 

Chlorine 

Item No. 2b 

Chlorine 

Item No. 2c 

Chlorine 

Item No. 3a 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 

Item No. 3b 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 

Item No. 3c 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 

Item No. 4a Caustic 

Soda 

Item No. 4b Caustic 

Soda 

Item No. 4c Caustic 

Soda 

Item No. 5 

Potassium 

Permanganate 

Bonded Chemical 

2645 Charter Street 

Columbus, Ohio 43228 

No Bid $1,800.00 No Bid No Bid $26,647.50 $15,565.20 $1,567.50 $104,563.20 $17,898.00 $218,500.00 $50,902.00 

Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. 

324 East Yusen Drive 

Georgetown, Kentucky 40324 

$288,000.00 $1,290.00 $18,800.00 $9,400.00 $22,950.00 $11,830.00 $1,350.00 $101,760.00 $19,350.00 $217,550.00 $51,100.00 

Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC 

90 East Halsey Road 

Parsippany, New Jersey 07054-

3705 

$180,792.00 No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

JCI Jones Chemical Inc. 

1765 Ringling Boulevard 

Sarasota, Florida 34236 

No Bid $1,100.00 $15,360.00 $7,680.00 No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid $171,000.00 No Bid 

Marubeni Specialty Chemicals, 

Inc. 

10 Bank Street 

White Plains, New York 10606 

No Bid No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48,246.00 

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 

10900 Harper Avenue 

Detroit, Michigan 48213 

No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid $25,245.00 $12,726.00 $1,485.00 $134,400.00 $17,587.50 $221,445.00 $76,059.00 

SAL Chemical Company 

3036 Birch Drive 

Weirton, West Virginia 26062 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15,732.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Shannon Chemical 

602 Jeffers Circle 116 

Exton, Pennsylvania 19341-

2539 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47,220.90 

 

$28,490.00 $2,777.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid  $51,414.00 

Univar USA Inc. 

4600 Dues Drive 

Cincinnati, Ohio  45246 

$239,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36,194.70 $17,500.00 $2,129.10 $114,713.60 $15,352,50 $214,348.50 $60,126.00 

 

 

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF. 
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IN RE:   DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT…BID OPENING FOR PROJECT NUMBER 2016-14 RELATIVE TO 

THE CITY OF MILFORD “RIVERSIDE PARK IMPROVEMENTS” PROJECT IN CONCERT WITH THE CLERMONT COUNTY 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT (CDBG) PROGRAM FOR FISCAL YEAR 2016…18-0613-001 

 

  

LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS 

UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR PROJECT NUMBER 

2016-04 RELATIVE TO THE CITY OF MILFORD “RIVERSIDE PARK IMPROVEMENTS” PROJECT IN CONCERT WITH THE CLERMONT COUNTY 

COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT (CDBG) PROGRAM FOR FISCAL YEAR 2016:    

 

 

Bidder Bid Amount 

Schweitzer Construction 

325 Clark Road 

Cincinnati, Ohio  45215 

$121,068.00 

 

 

 

 

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO ANDY KUCHTA, DEPARTMENT OF COMMUNITY AND ECONOMIC DEVELOPMENT, FOR HIS 

REVIEWAND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.   


