

COMMISSIONERS' JOURNAL #316 CLERMONT COUNTY BID OPENING 10/03/19

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...19-0719-002

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM:

Bidder	Item No. 1 Aluminum Sulfate	Item No. 2a Chlorine	Item No. 2b Chlorine	Item No. 2c Chlorine	Item No. 3a Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3b Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3c Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 4a Caustic Soda	Item No. 4b Caustic Soda	Item No. 4c Caustic Soda	Item No. 5 Potassium Permanganate
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 10900 Harper Avenue Detroit, Michigan 48213	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$149.10	\$94.35	\$185.00	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1765 Ringling Boulevard Sarasota, Florida 34236	No Bid	\$60.00	\$389.00	\$389.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Bonded Chemicals, Inc. 2645 Charter Street Columbus, Ohio 43228-4605	No Bid	\$73.50	No Bid	No Bid	\$139.70	\$220.00	\$139.70	\$124.60	\$90.61	\$166.40	\$478.93
Univar USA Inc. 4600 Dues Drive Cincinnati, Ohio 45246	\$127.14	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$121.99	\$200.00	\$201.355	\$190.196	\$83.80	\$164.90	\$551.76
SAL Chemical Company 3036 Birch Drive Weirton, West Virginia 26062	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$223.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation 602 Jeffers Circle 116 Exton, Pennsylvania 19341- 2539	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$477.77
Marubeni Specialty Chemicals 10 Bank Street, Suite 740 White Plains, New York 10606	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.545
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC 90 East Halsey Road Parsippany, New Jersey 07054	\$108.54	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. 324 East Yusen Drive Georgetown, Kentucky 40324	\$130.00	\$64.50	\$495.00	\$495.00	\$125.95	\$166.00	\$125.95	\$153.30	\$83.90	\$159.30	\$495.00

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.