

COMMISSIONERS' JOURNAL #318 CLERMONT COUNTY BID OPENING 10/22/20

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...20-0904-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM:

Bidder	Item No. 1 Aluminum Sulfate	Item No. 2a Chlorine	Item No. 2b Chlorine	Item No. 2c Chlorine	Item No. 3a Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3b Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3c Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 4a Caustic Soda	Item No. 4b Caustic Soda	Item No. 4c Caustic Soda	Item No. 5 Potassium Permanganate
Univar Solutions USA Inc. 124 Chapel Hill Drive Fairfield, Ohio 45014	\$240,894.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$89,881.60	\$9,924.00	\$115,900.00	\$51,327.00
Bonded Chemicals, Inc. 2645 Charter Street Columbus, Ohio 43228	No Bid	\$1,620.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$23,281.51	\$14,840.00	\$1,369.50	\$69,440.00	\$11,392.50	\$123,728.00	\$46,933.00
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. 1405 Highway 136 West Henderson, Kentucky 42420	No Bid	\$1,230.00	\$20,200.00	\$10,100.00	\$23,375.00	\$13,580.00	1,375.00	\$88,960.00	\$10,584.00	\$122,835.00	\$49,500.00
Pencco, Inc. 831 Bartlett Road Sealy, Texas 77474	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16,493.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 10900 Harper Avenue Detroit, Michigan 48213	\$166,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21,972.50	No Bid	\$1,292.50	\$86,016.00	\$13,500.00	\$138,937.50	No Bid

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.

CONTINUED ON NEXT PAGE

CONTINUED FROM LAST PAGE

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...20-0904-001

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM:

Bidder	Item No. 1 Aluminum Sulfate	Item No. 2a Chlorine	Item No. 2b Chlorine	Item No. 2c Chlorine	Item No. 3a Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3b Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 3c Hydrofluosilicic Acid	Item No. 4a Caustic Soda	Item No. 4b Caustic Soda	Item No. 4c Caustic Soda	Item No. 5 Potassium Permanganate
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC 90 East Halsey Road Parispany, New Jersey 07054	\$202,662.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
JCI Jones Chemicals, Inc. 1765 Ringling Boulevard Sarasota, Florida 34236	No Bid	\$780.00	\$15,740.00	\$7,870.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation PO Box 376 Malvern, Pennsylvania 19355	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45,771.00
Chemrite 5202 Belle Wood Court, Suite 104 Buford, Georgia 30518	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$47,156.00

SAID BIDS WERE ACCEPTED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.