COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #319 CLERMONT COUNTY BID OPENING  10/14/2021

INRE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR PROJECT NUMBER 6401-60175 RELATIVE TO THE BMW
FLOC/SED BASINS 1&2 AND LAKE INTAKE STRUCTURE, REHABILITATION AND PAINTING PROJECT LOCATED WITHIN THE BATAVIA

TOWNSHIP...21-0427-010

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BID(S) WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY
COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER
FOR PROJECT NUMBER 6401-60175 RELATIVE TO THE REHABILITATION AND PAINTING PROJECT LOCATED WITHIN THE BATAVIA TOWNSHIP :

BID #1 BID #2 BID #3
BIDDER BMW FLOC/SED BMW LAKE INTAKE COMBINATION OF BMW
BASINS 1 & 2 STRUCTURE FLOC/SED BASINS 1 & 2
AND LAKE INTAKE
STRUCTURE
A&N Construction $815,050.00 No Bid No Bid
15505 County Road K
Napoleon, Ohio 43545
Procoat Painting No Bid $172,282.00 No Bid
601 W. Main Street
Batavia, Ohio 45103
TMI Coatings $982,000.00 $217,000.00 $1,192,000.00
3291 Terminal Drive
St. Paul, Minnesota 55121
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SAID BID(S) WERE RECEIVED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION

FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.

Engineer’s Estimate: BID #1-$775,000.00; BID #2-$165,000.00; BID #3- $940,000.00



COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #319 CLERMONT COUNTY

IN RE:

BID OPENING

10/14/2021

CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR
THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...21-0804-005

LET THE RECORD SHOW:
COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER

FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM:

THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY

Bidder Item No. 1 Item No. 2a Item No. 2b Item No. 2¢ Item No. 3a Item No. 3b Item No. 3¢ Item No. 4a Item No. 4b Item No. 4c Item No. 5
Aluminum Chlorine Chlorine Chlorine Hydrofluosilicic Hydrofluosilicic Hydrofluosilicic Caustic Soda Caustic Soda Caustic Soda Potassium
Sulfate Acid Acid Acid Permanganate

PVS Nolwood

Chemicals, Inc.

i?/i?]%g'arper $118125 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid $176.00 $380.00 $176.00 $168.00 $283.00 $279.00 No Bid

Detroit, Michigan

48213

Bonded Chemicals,

Inc.

2645 Charter Street No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $147.95 $227.90 $175.00 $175.00 $141.25 $259.20 $651.58

Columbus, OH

43228

Univar USA Inc.

4600 Dues Drive No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $187.00 $214.00 $187.00 $200.60 $162.30 $310.10 $729.30

Cincinnati, Ohio
45246
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Shannon Chemical
Corporation

602 Jeffers Cir 116
Exton PA 19341-
2539

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$817.17

Chemtrade
Chemicals US LLC
90 East Halsey Road
Parsippany, New
Jersey 07054

$91.80

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

SAID BIDS WERE RECEIVED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM, CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT, FOR HIS REVIEW AND

RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.




