
COMMISSIONERS’ JOURNAL #321 CLERMONT COUNTY       BID OPENING      10/13/2022 
 

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 

CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM...22-0824-004 

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDS WERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT 

COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD 

SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALS FOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS 

SYSTEM: 

Bidder Item No. 1 

Aluminum 

Sulfate 

Item No. 2a 

Chlorine 

Item No. 2b 

Chlorine 

Item No. 2c 

Chlorine 

Item No. 3a 

Hydrofluosilicic 

Acid 

Item No. 3b 

Hydrofluosilicic Acid 

Item No. 3c 

Hydrofluosilicic 

Acid 

Item No. 4a  

Caustic Soda 

Item No. 4b  

Caustic Soda 

Item No. 4c  

Caustic Soda 

Item No. 5 Potassium 

Permanganate 

PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc. 

10900 Harper Avenue 

Detroit, MI 

48213 
$268,400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30,855.00 $23,069.00 $1,815.00 $147,840.00 $27,411.00 $392,986.50 $80,850.00 

Bonded Chemicals 

2645 Charter Street 

Columbus, Ohio 

43228 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29,826.50 $18,788.00 $1,754.50 $154,560.00 $25,800.00 $345,800.00 $86,987.00 
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Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC 

90 East Halsey Road, Suite 200 

Parsippany, New Jersey 

07054 

$236,520.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

Shannon Chemical 

P.O. Box 376 

Malvern, Pennsylvania 

19355 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $124,447.00 

Univar 

4600 Dues Drive 

Cincinnati, Ohio 

45246 

$252,650.00 No Bid No Bid  No Bid  No Bid No Bid  No Bid $180,608.00 $27,965.00 $351,975.00 $95,370.00 

Marubeni America Corporation 

500 Mamaroneck Ave, Ste. 504 

Harrison, New York 

10528 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71,991.20 
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Breentag Mid-South, Inc 

324 East Yusen Drive 

Georgetown, Ky 

40324 

 

No Bid $4,320.00 $101,680.00 $50,840.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27,150.00 $344,850.00 $158,400.50 

Chemrite, Inc. 

5202 Belle Wood Court 

Suite 104 

Buford, GA 

30518 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $98,876.00 

 

 
 

 

 

 

SAID BID(S) WERE RECEIVED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESCOURCES DIRECTOR, FOR HIS REVIEW AND 

RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.  
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IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES  

DEPARTMENT… BID OPENING FOR SR 132 WATER 

SERVICE CONNECTIONS; PROJECT 6401-60152…22-0906-

003 

 

LET THE RECORD SHOW:  THAT THE FOLLOWING BID(S) WERE RECEIVED IN 

THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT COUNTY COMMISSIONERS UNTIL 

2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME THIS DATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND 

READ ALOUD SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR SR 132 WATER SERVICE 

CONNECTIONS; PROJECT 6401-60152: 
 

 

 
Bidder Bid Amount 

Ford Development Corp. 

11148 Woodward Lane 

Cincinnati, Ohio  45241 

 

$434,040.00 

 

 

SAID BID(S) WERE RECEIVED AND REFERRED TO LYLE BLOOM CLERMONT 

COUNTY WATER RESCOURCES DIRECTOR, FOR HIS REVIEW AND 

RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION THEREOF.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
   


