COMMISSIONERS JOURNAL #324 CLERMONT COUNTY BID OPENING  10/02/2025

IN RE: CLERMONT COUNTY WATER RESOURCES DEPARTMENT...BID OPENING FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
CHEMICALSFOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS SYSTEM .....25-0807-002

LET THE RECORD SHOW: THAT THE FOLLOWING BIDSWERE RECEIVED IN THE OFFICE OF THE BOARD OF CLERMONT

COUNTY COMMISSIONERSUNTIL 2:00 P.M.LOCAL TIME THISDATE WHERE THEY WERE PUBLICLY OPENED AND READ ALOUD
SHORTLY THEREAFTER FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF CHEMICALSFOR THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS

SYSTEM:
Bidder Item No. 1 Item No. 2 Item No. 3a Item No. 3b Item No. 4a Item No. 4b Item No. 4c Item No. 5a Item No. 5b Item No. 5¢c Item No. 6 Item No. 7
Aluminum Chlorine Chlorine Chlorine Hydrofluosilicic | Hydrofluosilicic | Hydrofluosilicic | Caustic Soda Caustic Soda Caustic Soda | Potassium Polymer
Sulfate Acid Acid Acid Permanganate
Univar Solutions USA | $288450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $68970.00 No Bid
LLC
929 Nelson Place

Trenton, Ohio 45067
Bonded Chemicals, Inc. | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $36465.00 $21712.95 $2475.00 $111804.00 (55 | $17839.50 $215203.50 $62843.00 No Bid

2645 Charter Street gal drum)
Columbus, Ohio 43228

$102220.80
(Totes)
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.| No Bid $3840.00 $95120.00 $47560.00 $31535.00 No Bid $1855.00 $127380.00 $17908.50 $195035.00 $69820.00 No Bid

324 East Yusen Drive
Georgetown, KY 40324

Chemtrade Chemicals | $323797.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

90 East Halsey Road
Par sippany, New Jer sey

07054
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Marubeni America Corp | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $88153.20 No Bid
500 Mamar oneck Avenue
Suite 504
Harrison, New York 10528]
PV S Nolwood Chemicals | $299250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $35360.00 $24010.00 $2080.00 $99000.00 $20700.00 $251750.00 No Bid No Bid
10900 Harper Avenue
Detroit, Michigan 48213
Polydyne, Inc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14094.00 (55
One Chemical Plant Road gallon
Riceboro, Georgia, 31323 drums)
$12006.00
(330 gallon
totes)
JCI Jones Chemical, Inc. | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $250531.50 No Bid No Bid
600 Bethel Avenue
Beech Grove, IN 46107
Chemrite, Incorporated | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $71429.00 No Bid
5202 Belle Wood Court,
Suite 104
Buford Georgia, 30518
. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Shannon Chemical
Corporation
P.O. Box 375
Malvern, Pennsylvania
19355

SAID BID(S) WERE RECEIVED AND REFERRED THE CLERMONT COUNTY WATERWORKS REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION FOR DISPOSITION

THEREOF.



